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Enquiry Type Enquiry Reference Description Enquiry 

Date

Enquiry 

Closed 

Date

Enquiry 

Target Date

Closed 

Within 

Target

Appeal 

Received

EIR Request

PE\2023\ENQ\48974 EIR - Any documentation relating to all matters associating the camping barn in Bradwell 

also known as 

Columbine Barn and []. Planning applications NP/DDD/0214/0223, 

NP/DDD/0813/0745 and NP/DDD/0317/0211 are associated with this request. Can you 

please 

provide all letters, emails and records of phone conversations associated with this property 

since 

the initial planning application was submitted. 

RESPONSE:

13/12/2023 - final response, information for relevant applications and following enquiries 

and enforcement cases provided - 28624, 33907, 39330, 17/0005 and 20/0112.

16 Nov 2023 13 Dec 2023 13 Dec 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48965 EIR request- 

1) The total number of reports made to the authority about obstructed/blocked/inaccessible 

public rights of way in:

i) 2022

ii) 2023, up to and including 31st October.

2) The total number of public rights of way in your area that were recorded as 

obstructed/blocked/inaccessible on: 

i) 31st December 2022

ii) 31st October 2023

3) The total number of Section 130A Notices under the Highways Act 1980 relating to 

obstructions on public rights of way served on the authority in: 

i) 2022

ii) 2023, up to and including 31st October.

4) The total number of unresolved Section 130A Notices relating to obstructions on public 

rights of way still being dealt with by the authority on 31st October 2023.

RESPONSE:

06/12/2023 - Final response, some information provided.  

14 Nov 2023 06 Dec 2023 11 Dec 2023 YES NO

EIR FOI and SAR Disclosure Report
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PE\2023\ENQ\48944 EIR - further to my request of 24 July and PDNPA response of 18 August, what I am trying 

to find out is the success or otherwise, of the predator control being undertaken on 

Warslow Moor.  I imagine that the people who manage it know who is doing what, and 

what effects in terms of breeding bird numbers must be.  After all, if they didn't have the 

information, they wouldn't be able to manage the process with any hope of success..

All I want is copy of the contract or tender document for the predator control, and whatever 

bird data the people managing Warslow use themselves. If it is necessary to pay for this 

information, please let me know how much it will cost.

See 48331

RESPONSE:

28/11/2023 - Final response, provision of copy of tender document, refusal of bird data 

citing Reg 12(5)(g) of EIR - protection of enviroment.  

04 Nov 2023 28 Nov 2023 30 Nov 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48932 EIR - Request submitted by Addland

The majority of our data sets are gathered through open data licences from a range of 

sources such as the Environment Agency, HMLR, OS & Historic England. However, with 

high interest from our customer base, there are several data sets that we believe are held 

directly by you as a local planning authority, including:

" Contaminated Land Sites

" Building Use Class Data

" Settlement Boundaries

We understand these data sets should be available publicly and ideally in a geospatial 

format.

I would be most grateful if you could point me towards the relevant contact for the above 

data sets so we can integrate them into the Addland platform. 

I very much look forward to hearing from you and please do not hesitate to get in touch 

with any questions.

RESPONSE:

08/11/2023 - Final response - information not held

01 Nov 2023 08 Nov 2023 28 Nov 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48981 EIR -  request for copies of all correspondence relating to the proposed TPO, the site or the 

application between council officer or members.

SEE ALSO PE\2021\ENQ\44334 and PE\2023\ENQ\47085

RESPONSE:

30/11/2023 - final response, redacted copies of correspondence provided via MailBigFile

03 Nov 2023 30 Nov 2023 30 Nov 2023 YES NO
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PE\2023\ENQ\48666 EIR - request or access to copies of the paper files related to both the Travellers Rest/The 

Knights Table at the Travellers Rest, any electronic applications for same and copies of any 

correspondence/reports/file notes for same, including any enforcement cases

13/10/2023 - Initial response - some information provided.  Coming in to view Pfiles 

20/10/2023

21 Sep 2023 13 Oct 2023 18 Oct 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48899 EIR - received via WhatDoTheyKnow.com.

Please provide all emails and other related documents that pertain to a change in use 

application for the former Staffordshire Knott Public House, Pown Street, Sheen that have 

been received, produced and sent since 1 July 2023.

RESPONSE:

24/11/2023 - Final response - email thread for given time frame provided. Personal data 

redacted.

28/11/2023 - 2 additional email threads provided.

30 Oct 2023 24 Nov 2023 24 Nov 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\49106 FOI - submitted via WhatDoTheyKnow

(postcodes SK17 0ES, SK17 0ET and SK17 0EU)

For these postcodes please provide:

1. Your most recent study of the bat population

2. The plan / strategy to protect bats in this area

3. A list of all outstanding planning / change of use applications

4. The bat reports for each

5. The questions around bats asked for each

6. The conditions around protecting bats for each

7. The dates any decisions on outstanding planning / change of use applications are 

expected to be considered 

8. Decisions on outstanding planning / change of use applications made since 1 June 2023.

RESPONSE:

19/12/2023 - Final response - some information provided, links to validation guidance on 

website and to public portal for application documents.

18 Dec 2023 19 Dec 2023 17 Jan 2024 YES NO
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PE\2023\ENQ\48812 EIR - request for copies of correspondence re report of alleged breach of planning control.

RESPONSE:

16/10/2023 - information withheld citing Reg 13(2A) EIR. I have looked at the 

correspondence to establish whether the content itself would reveal the identify of the 

individual(s) who initially contacted us, and have concluded that, even with redaction, 

identity could be inferred. 

02 Oct 2023 16 Oct 2023 27 Oct 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48586 EIR - research into planned building maintenance for listed buildings and requesting 

completion of questions in attached Word document.

Could all documents be provided elecronically. If a problem, then happy to discuss rather 

than hold up the  FOI process. Happy to discuss with a member of the property team if that 

would be helpful.

RESPONSE:

25/09/2023 - Request for clarification.

26/09/2023 - Request for extentsion of time

20/10/2023 - Final response - completed questionnaire provided and survey for Reapsmoor 

School and Chapel provided,

11 Sep 2023 20 Oct 2023 20 Oct 2023 YES NO

FOI Request

PE\2023\ENQ\48763 FOI Request: re planning appeal cost award or partial cost award made against your council 

& planning appeal cost award or partial cost award made against an applicant in your 

council's favour.

RESPONSE:

24/10/2023 - Final response, information provided in part - only 1 award made in favour of 

Authority in timeframe requested.  

05 Oct 2023 24 Oct 2023 01 Nov 2023 YES NO
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PE\2023\ENQ\49031 FOI - submitted via WhatDoTheyKnow. I would be most grateful if you would provide me, 

under the Freedom of Information Act, details in respect to the contract below.

5 YEAR CONTRACT FOR SERVICES ASSOCIATED WITH THE MAINTENANCE, MONITORING 

AND INSTALLATION OF INTRUDER AND FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS WITHIN NATIONAL PARK 

AUTHORITY PROPERTIES:

https://linkscan.io/scan/ux/aHR0cHM6Ly93d3cuY29udHJhY3RzZmluZGVyLnNlcnZpY2UuZ29

2LnVrL05vdGljZS84NzQ1YzVjNy0zZGYxLTRmNDgtOTEzNS05MTM5NDQ2MjY2YzE=/32BC37

C94A8C0FD475653BEEFAAD903AEBB7C247BAAF1260A1AB55A0E56CAC48?c=5&i=1&docs

=1

The details we require are:

 - What are the contractual performance KPI's for this contract?

 - Suppliers who applied for inclusion on each framework/contract and were successful & 

not successful at the PQQ & ITT stages 

- Actual spend on this contract/framework (and any sub lots), from the start of the contract 

to the current date

- Start date & duration of framework/contract?

- Could you please provide a copy of the service/product specification given to all bidders 

for when this contract was last advertised?

-  Is there an extension clause in the framework(s)/contract(s) and, if so, the duration of 

the extension?

- Has a decision been made yet on whether the framework(s)/contract(s) are being either 

extended or renewed?

- Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for this contract?

RESPONSE: 

2012/2023 - Final response, some information provided. Specification withheld citing 

Section 31(1)(a) of FOI, detection and prevention of crime.

30 Nov 2023 20 Dec 2023 27 Dec 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48958 FOI: TV/film productions in Peak District Hello, I am writing to request information in 

relation to TV/film productions in the Peak District under the Freedom of Information Act. 

Here is the information I would like you to provide: The number of applications made to the 

authority asking for permission to film TV shows and films in the Peak District. Please 

provides figures over the following years: o 2017/18 o 2018/19 o 2019/20 o 2020/21 o 

2021/22 o 2022/23 o 2023/24 The amount of income the authority has received from 

production companies for filming taking place in the Peak District for films and television 

shows. o 2017/18 o 2018/19 o 2019/20 o 2020/21 o 2021/22 o 2022/23 o 2023/24 What 

sites in the area were the requests made for and for what films/TV shows? Please provide 

the numbers/amount made for each site/publication if you're able to. o 2017/18 o 2018/19 

o 2019/20 o 2020/21 o 2021/22 o 2022/23 o 2023/24 I look forward to hearing back. 

RESPONSE:

24/11/2023 - Final response - information provided

10 Nov 2023 24 Nov 2023 07 Dec 2023 YES NO
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PE\2023\ENQ\49059 FOI - Request for Information on the ASC Waiting List

RESPONSE:

07/12/2023 - Final response, information not held. Adult Social Care is not a function of the 

National Park Authority.

07 Dec 2023 07 Dec 2023 03 Jan 2024 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48817 FOI - Please supply Members lists from 2012 to 2023 year by year.

RESPONSE:

23/10/2023 - Final response - information provided

16 Oct 2023 23 Oct 2023 10 Nov 2023 YES NO

PE\2023\ENQ\48842 FOI request:

1. How much did your organisation spend on the procurement of goods and services in the 

last financial year?

2. How many employees did your organisation have in the last financial year?

3. How much land and property does your organisation own within South Yorkshire?

4. How much CO2 did your organisation emit in the previous year? 

See attached email for further details on request.

RESPONSE:

16/11/2023 - Final response, some information provided, some information not held.

20 Oct 2023 16 Nov 2023 16 Nov 2023 YES NO


